
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 19-0401

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Non-Electrical Hand Tools

TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2019)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 28, 2019
  

GROUP NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

GROUP 1. BAR, ALIGNING PRY:
15 ea. PRICE 16.71 20.58 8.20 11.28 13.55 12.38
SIZE 1/2" X 16" (9379) TOTAL 250.65 308.70 123.00 169.20 203.25 185.70

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto/J2116 Armstrong 70-503G Select 73086837 Mayhew/4000 Proto J2116 Proto J2116 NO BID
10 ea. PRICE 31.03 26.58 13.40 13.88 18.89 17.24
SIZE 5/8" X 18" ROLLING HEAD (9382) TOTAL 310.30 265.80 134.00 138.80 188.90 172.40

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto/J2130 Armstrong 70-521G Proto J2120 Mayhew/40102 Proto J2120 Proto J2120 NO BID
10 ea. PRICE 29.26 27.44 18.09 19.83 35.02 22.94
SIZE 3/4" X 24" (9378) TOTAL 292.60 274.40 180.90 198.30 350.20 229.40

3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto/J2124 Armstrong 70-505G Proto J2124 Mayhew/40003 Proto J2124-IT Proto J2124 NO BID
  *
  

 TOTAL FOR GROUP 1 TOTAL 853.55 848.90 437.90 506.30 742.35 587.50
GROUP 2 BLADE:

10 ea. PRICE 1.73 7.62 5.48
CUTTING, SIZE 6, TPI 7, WOOD (9663) TOTAL 17.30 76.20 54.80

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Irwin/372606 NO BID Irwin/372606 NO BID NO BID Freud DS0612BW NO BID
40 ea. PRICE 1.64 1.98 9.05 4.65
CUTTING, SIZE 6, TPI 10, FINE WOOD (9664) TOTAL 65.60 79.20 362.00 186.00

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Irwin/327610 NO BID Irwin/327610 Dewalt DW4806 NO BID Freud BR10765 NO BID
5 ea. PRICE 11.20 1.46   
CUTTING, SIZE 4-1/8", TPI 6, WOOD (9665) TOTAL 56.00 7.30   

3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Lenox/20449456RP NO BID Lenox/20449456RP NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 ea. PRICE 29.33    
HACKSAW, SIZE 9, TPI 10, (9670) TOTAL 586.60

4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Lenox/210974110GR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15 ea. PRICE 16.53 8.00 14.36 1.39  
HACKSAW, SIZE 12, TPI 14, (9669) TOTAL 247.95 120.00 215.40 20.85  

5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Stanley/B&D/20143V214HE NO BID Stanley/B&D/20143V214HE Lenox V214HE Nicholson 62706N  NO BID NO BID
10 ea. PRICE 1.57  14.36  1.36
HACKSAW, SIZE 12, TPI 24, (9666) TOTAL 15.70  143.60  13.60

6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Stanley/B&D/201555224HE NO BID NO BID Lenox V232HE NO BID Lenox 224HE NO BID
1,000 ea. PRICE 1.75  135.90  135.90
HACKSAW, SIZE 12, TPI 32, (9668) TOTAL 1,750.00  135,900.00  1.37

7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Stanley/B&D/201565232HE NO BID NO BID Lenox V232HE NO BID Lenox 2232HE NO BID
10 ea. PRICE 12.53 1.05 7.76  4.93
JIGSAW, SIZE 4, TPI 10 (9671) TOTAL 125.30 10.50 77.60  49.30

8. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Stanley/B&D/199062 NO BID Lenox/2029SCF450SR Milwaukee 48-42-2310 NO BID Bosch T101B NO BID
100 ea. PRICE 9.52 6.50 9.14  10.90
BLADE PVC PIPE SAW 18INTPI 11, LENOX HSB18 (9672) TOTAL 952.00 650.00 914.00  1,090.00

9. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Stanley/B&D/20981HSB18 NO BID Lenox 20981 Lenox HSB18 NO BID Lenox HSB18 NO BID
*   

      
 TOTAL GROUP 2 TOTAL 3,816.45       
GROUP 3 DRILL BIT, HIGH SPEED:

25 ea. PRICE 0.89 0.43 0.47 0.71 0.47 0.99
SIZE 1/16" (11461) TOTAL 22.25 10.75 11.75 17.75 11.75 24.75

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205637 Drill Amer D/AN 1/16 FMT 03106370 Irwin 3019004B Irwin 60104
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 19-0401

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Non-Electrical Hand Tools

TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2019)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 28, 2019
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35 ea. PRICE 0.93 0.55 0.49 0.91 0.66 1.09
SIZE 1/8" (11464) TOTAL 32.55 19.25 17.15 31.85 23.10 38.15

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205678 Drill Amer D/AN 1/8 FMT 03106374 Irwin 3019008B Irwin 60108
50 ea. PRICE 1.81 1.12 1.04 1.70 0.99 2.29
SIZE 1/4" (11463) TOTAL 90.50 56.00 52.00 85.00 49.50 114.50

3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205751 Drill Amer D/AN 1/4 FMT 0306382 Irwin 3019016B Irwin 60116
15 ea. PRICE 6.92 3.90 4.29 6.39 3.68 7.95
SIZE 1/2" (11462) TOTAL 103.80 58.50 64.35 95.85 55.20 119.25

4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205918 Drill Amer D/AN 1/2 FMT 03106398 Irwin 3019032B Irwin 60132
15 ea. PRICE 1.10 0.91 0.74 1.30 0.68 1.59
SIZE 3/16" (11472) TOTAL 16.50 13.65 11.10 19.50 10.20 23.85

5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205710 Drill Amer D/AN 3/16 FMT 03106378 Irwin 3019012B Irwin 60112
10 ea. PRICE 0.89 0.70 0.42 0.75 0.49 0.99
SIZE 3/32" (11474) TOTAL 8.90 7.00 4.20 7.50 4.90 9.90

6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205652 Drill Amer D/AN 3/32 FMT 03106372 Irwin 3019006B Irwin 60106
30 ea. PRICE 4.05 2.33 2.34 3.79 2.09 4.95
SIZE 3/8" (11475) TOTAL 121.50 69.90 70.20 113.70 62.70 148.50

7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205835 Drill Amer D/AN 3/8 FMT 03106390 Irwin 3019024B Irwin 60124
20 ea. PRICE 2.85 1.30 1.68 2.57 1.54 3.95
SIZE 5/16" (11476) TOTAL 57.00 26.00 33.60 51.40 30.80 79.00

8. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205793 Drill Amer D/AN 5/16 FMT 03106386 Irwin 3019020B Irwin 60120
20 ea. PRICE 1.05 0.63 0.59 1.04 0.50 1.29
SIZE 5/32" (11477) TOTAL 21.00 12.60 11.80 20.80 10.00 25.80

9. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205694 Drill Amer D/AN 5/32 FMT 03106376 Irwin 3019010B Irwin 60110
10 ea. PRICE 4.69 2.94 3.24 5.14 3.05 5.95
SIZE 7/16" (11478) TOTAL 46.90 29.40 32.40 51.40 30.50 59.50

10. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205876 Drill Amer D/AN 7/16 FMT 03106394 Irwin 3019028B Irwin 60128
 10 ea. UNIT 1.59 1.13 0.92 1.44 0.84 1.99

SIZE 7/32" (11479) PRICE 15.90 11.30 9.20 14.40 8.40 19.90
11. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205736 Drill Amer D/AN 7/32 FMT 03106380 Irwin 3019014B Irwin 60114

10 ea. UNIT 0.97 0.86 0.44 0.80 1.05 0.99
SIZE 7/64" (11480) PRICE 9.70 8.60 4.40 8.00 10.50 9.90

12. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205660 Drill Amer D/AN 7/64 FMT 03106373 Irwin 3019007B Irwin 60107
20 ea. UNIT 2.26 1.43 1.43 2.16 1.41 2.95
SIZE 9/32" (11481) PRICE 45.20 28.60 28.60 43.20 28.20 59.00

13. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205777 Drill Amer D/AN 9.32 FMT 03106384 Irwin 3019018B Irwin 60118
10 ea. UNIT 1.00 0.62 0.53 0.97 0.52 1.19
SIZE 9/64" (11482) PRICE 10.00 6.20 5.30 9.70 5.20 11.90

14. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205686 Drill Amer D/AN 9/64 FMT 03106375 Irwin 3019009B Irwin 60109
10 ea. UNIT 3.46 1.97 2.08 3.24 1.97 4.59
SIZE 11/32" (11465) PRICE 34.60 19.70 20.80 32.40 19.70 45.90

15. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205819 Drill Amer D/AN 11/32 FMT 03106388 Irwin 3019022B Irwin 60122
10 ea. UNIT 1.14 0.84 0.67 1.08 0.60 1.39
SIZE 11/64" (11466) PRICE 11.40 8.40 6.70 10.80 6.00 13.90

16. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205702 Drill Amer D/AN 11/64 FMT 03106377 Irwin 3019011B Irwin 60111
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 19-0401

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Non-Electrical Hand Tools

TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2019)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 28, 2019
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10 ea. UNIT 21.44 3.27 2.80 4.38 2.59 5.95
SIZE 13/32" (11467) PRICE 214.40 32.70 28.00 43.80 25.90 59.50

17. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205850 Drill Amer D/AN 13/32 FMT 03106392 Irwin 3019026B Irwin 60126
10 ea. UNIT 18.92 0.82 0.81 1.41 0.78 1.89
SIZE 13/64" (11468) PRICE 189.20 8.20 8.10 14.10 7.80 18.90

18. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205728 Drill Amer D/AN 13/64 FMT 03106379 Irwin 3019013B Irwin 60113
10 ea. UNIT 6.49 4.43 3.85 6.04 3.50 7.95
SIZE 15/32" (11469) PRICE 64.90 44.30 38.50 60.40 35.00 79.50

19. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205892 Drill Amer D/AN 15/35 FMT 03106396 Irwin 3019030B Irwin 60130
10 ea. PRICE 1.69 1.51 1.01 1.55 0.93 1.95
SIZE 15/64" (11470) TOTAL 16.90 15.10 10.10 15.50 9.30 19.50

20. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205744 Drill Amer D/AN 15/64 SPBG 03106381 Irwin 3019015B Irwin 60115
10 ea. PRICE 2.18 1.78 1.31 2.03 1.19 2.49
SIZE 17/64" (11471) TOTAL 21.80 17.80 13.10 20.30 11.90 24.90

21. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205769 Drill Amer D/AN 17/64 SPBG 03106383 Irwin 3019017B Irwin 60117
*

        
 TOTAL GROUP 3 TOTAL 1,154.90  503.95 481.35 767.35 456.55 1,006.00
GROUP 4 DRILL BIT, GENERAL PURPOSE:

10 ea. PRICE 0.89 0.45 0.47 0.53 0.47 0.99
SIZE 1/16" (11454) TOTAL 8.90 4.50 4.70 5.30 4.70 9.90

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205637 Drill Amer D/AN 1/16 FMT 03106399 Irwin 3019004B Irwin 60104
10 ea. PRICE 4.69 2.94 3.24 3.86 3.05 5.95
SIZE 7/16" (11502) TOTAL 46.90 29.40 32.40 38.60 30.50 59.50

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205876 Drill Amer D/AN 7/16 FMT 03106423 Irwin 3019028B Irwin 60128
10 ea. PRICE 17.38 10.00 24.40 15.20 6.92 9.95
SIZE 9/16" X 1/2" SHANK (11458) TOTAL 173.80 100.00 244.00 152.00 69.20 99.50

3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/71205876 Drill Amer D/ARSD 9/16 FMT 03106431 Irwin 91136 Bosch BL2163
5 ea. PRICE 19.46 12.00 27.48 16.94 7.63 10.95
SIZE 5/8" X 1/2" SHANK (11456) TOTAL 97.30 60.00 137.40 84.70 38.15 54.75

4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/83240366 Drill Amer D/ARSD 5/8 FMT 03106435 Irwin 91140 Bosch BL2167
10 ea. PRICE 21.01 35.00 33.26 124.75 9.08 12.95
SIZE 3/4" (11455) TOTAL 210.10 350.00 332.60 1,247.50 90.80 129.50

5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/705 NO BID Hertel/83240408 Drill Amer D/ARSD 3/4 FMT 03106443 Irwin 91148 Bosch BL2175
10 ea. PRICE 25.07  40.25 24.62 11.08 16.95
SIZE 7/8" (11457) TOTAL 250.70  402.50 246.20 110.80 169.50

6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/705 NO BID NO BID Drill Amer D/ARSD 7/8 FMT 03106451 Irwin 91156 Bosch BL2183
10 ea. PRICE 32.26  52.15 31.96  19.95
SIZE 1" (11459) TOTAL 322.60  521.50 319.60  199.50

7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/705 NO BID NO BID Drill Amer D/ARSD1 FMT 03106459  Bosch BL2191
*

  

 TOTAL GROUP 4 TOTAL 1,110.30 NO BID  1,675.10 2,093.90 344.15 722.15
GROUP 5 DRILL BIT, MASONRY:

15 ea. PRICE 5.11 1.25 1.11 4.31 2.26 3.95
SIZE 1/4" (11488) TOTAL 76.65 18.75 16.65 64.65 33.90 59.25

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/CM86-1/4 NO BID Tru-Cut/W2506 Drill Amer DAM6X1/4 Milwaukee 48-20-8811 Bosch HCBG06T Irwin 326005
15 ea. PRICE 6.00 1.75 1.65 29.33 3.68 7.95
SIZE 3/8" (11490) TOTAL 90.00 26.25 24.75 439.95 55.20 119.25

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/CM86-3/8 NO BID Tru-Cut/W3756 Drill Amer DAM6X3/8x3/8 Milwaukee 48-20-8821 Bosch HCBG012T Irwin 326011

3
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10 ea. PRICE 5.60 1.50 1.45 4.43 3.00 4.49
SIZE 5/16" (11491) TOTAL 56.00 15.00 14.50 44.30 30.00 44.90

3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/CM86-5/16 NO BID Tru-Cut/W3126 Drill Amer DAM6X5/16 Milwaukee 48-20-816 Bosch HCBG09T Irwin 326008
5 ea. PRICE 6.49 2.00 1.96 10.49 4.43 5.95
SIZE 7/16" (11492) TOTAL 32.45 10.00 9.80 52.45 22.15 29.75

4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/CM86-7/16 NO BID Tru-Cut/W4376 Drill Amer DAM6X7/16 ARTU-USA 01060 Bosch HCBG15T Irwin 326014
5 ea. PRICE 10.28 2.92 2.42 17.04 8.59  
SIZE 9/16" (11494) TOTAL 51.40 14.60 12.10 85.20 42.95  

5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/CM86-9/16 NO BID Tru-Cut/W5626 Drill Amer DAM6X9/16 ARTU-USA 01075 Bosch HCBG19T NO BID
5 ea. PRICE 12.92 6.00 6.49 85.60 11.09 20.95
SIZE 3/4" (11489) TOTAL 64.60 30.00 32.45 428.00 55.45 104.75

6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/CM86-3/4 NO BID Tru-Cut/W7506 Drill Amer DAM6X3/4 ARTU-USA DWA54034 Bosch HCBG22T Irwin 326022
5 ea. PRICE 16.50 7.31 6.97 44.93 12.66 22.95
SIZE 7/8" (11493) TOTAL 82.50 36.55 34.85 224.65 63.30 114.75

7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/CM86-7/8 NO BID Tru-Cut/W8756 Drill Amer DAM6X7/8 ARTU-USA 01097 Bosch HCBG24T Irwin 326024
10 ea. PRICE 0.91  1.57 5.97 2.13 20.95
SIZE 3/16" X 4", (11496) TOTAL 9.10  15.70 59.70 21.30 209.50

8. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/CSC4-3/16 NO BID NO BID Drill Amer DAM4X3/16 Milwaukee 48-20-8850 Bosch HCBG04T Irwin 326003
5 ea. PRICE   3.23 22.28   
SIZE 5/8" X 8", W/ 3/8" SHANK (11487) TOTAL   16.15 111.40   

9. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL NO BID NO BID NO BID Drill Amer DAM6X5/8X3/8 Milwaukee 48-20-7200 NO BID NO BID
5 ea. PRICE 14.39 11.00 15.26 30.20 9.38  
SIZE 5/8" X 12", (11485) TOTAL 71.95 55.00 76.30 151.00 46.90  

10. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/CM12-5/8 NO BID Cleline/C20974 Drill Amer DAM13X5/8X1/2 Milwaukee 48-20-7203 Bosch HCBG21T NO BID
5 ea. PRICE 11.97 6.92 4.63 9.06 9.24  
SIZE 1/2" X 12", (11484) TOTAL 59.85 34.60 23.15 45.30 46.20  

11. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/CM12-1/2 NO BID Cleline/C20973 Drill Amer DAM13X1/2X3/8 Dewalt DW5439 Bosch HCBG18T NO BID
5 ea. PRICE 18.21  18.20    
SIZE 1/2" X 16", W/ 3/8" SHANK (11498) TOTAL 91.05  91.00    

12. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/CM18-1/2 NO BID NO BID Drill Amer DAM18X12 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 ea. PRICE 24.32 10.00 9.15  21.51  
SIZE 3/4" X 13", (11483) CARBIDE TIP TOTAL 121.60 50.00 45.75  107.55  

13. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/CM18-3/4 NO BID Tru-Cut/X75013 Drill Amer DAM13X3/4 NO BID Bosch HCBG23T NO BID
5 ea. PRICE 23.20  14.72  38.67  
SIZE 1" X 10", W/ 1/2" SHANK (11486) TOTAL 116.00  73.60  193.35  

14. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/CM12-A NO BID NO BID Drill Amer DAM13X1 NO BID Eagle Tap VM4400 NO BID
5 ea. PRICE 23.20 16.78 14.72  33.39  
SIZE 1" X 12", (11495) TOTAL 116.00 83.90 73.60  166.95  

15. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/CM12-1 NO BID Cleline/C20977 Drill Amer DAM13X1 NO BID Bosch HCBG27T NO BID
 *
  
TOTAL GROUP 5 TOTAL    560.35    

GROUP 6 DRILL BIT HAMMER, MASONRY:
5 ea. PRICE 28.22 20.00 19.75 19.99 14.10
SIZE 3/8" X 11" SPLINE (11506) TOTAL 141.10 100.00 98.75 99.95 70.50

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/CM97-3/8x8x13 NO BID Bosch/93304 Dewalt DW5700 Bosch HC4501 Dewalt DW5701 NO BID 
10 ea. PRICE 9.15 7.00 26.44 26.44 5.52
SIZE 3/8" X 12" SDS (11503) TOTAL 91.50 70.00 264.40 264.40 55.20

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/CM9503/8x10x12 NO BID Bosch/HC2064 Dewalt DW5701 Dewalt DW5430 Dewalt DW5430 NO BID 
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 5 ea. PRICE 19.33 9.50   24.00
SIZE 3/8" X 20" SDS (11504) TOTAL 96.65 47.50   120.00

3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/CM95-3/8/22x24 NO BID Irwin/326013 NO BID NO BID Dewalt DW5432 NO BID 
10 ea. PRICE 12.40 9.00   13.66
SIZE 1/2" X 12" (11497) TOTAL 124.00 90.00   136.60

4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/SM95-1/2x10x12 NO BID Bosch/HC2084 NO BID NO BID Dewalt DW5539 NO BID 
20 ea. PRICE 24.60 18.00  17.62 17.85
SIZE 1/2" X 16" SPLINE (11505) TOTAL 492.00 360.00  352.40 357.00

5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/CM97-3/1/2x11x16 NO BID Powers/1409 NO BID Dewalt DW5704 Dewalt DW5704 NO BID 
3 ea. PRICE 34.27 25.00   19.25
SIZE 1/2" X 23" SPLINE (11507) TOTAL 102.81 75.00   57.75

6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/CM97-1/2x27x22 NO BID Bosch/HC2088 NO BID NO BID Dewalt DW5705 NO BID 
10 ea. PRICE 84.32 75.00   79.00
SIZE 1 1/2" X 23" SPLINE (11508) TOTAL 843.20 750.00   790.00

7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Champion/CM97 NO BID Powers/1477 NO BID NO BID Dewalt DW5764 NO BID 
  *    
      
TOTAL GROUP 6 TOTAL 1,891.26  1,492.50   1,587.05  

GROUP 7 FILES:
10 ea. UNIT 6.44 5.77 3.00 5.62 6.82 5.21 9.95

SIZE 6", BASTARD FLAT (11887) PRICE 64.40 57.70 30.00 56.20 68.20 52.10 99.50
1. NICHOLSON 3467 OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL Exact Match Nicholson/03467N Nicholson/08354N Nicholson/03467 Nicholson/03467 ATG 3467 Apex 3467

15 ea. UNIT 8.02 7.19 3.15 7.00 8.47 6.49 10.95

SIZE 8", BASTARD FLAT (11888) PRICE 120.30 107.85 47.25 105.00 127.05 97.35 164.25
2. NICHOLSON 3566 OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL Exact Match Nicholson/03566N Nicholson/08147N Nicholson/03566N Nicholson/03566N ATG 3566 Apex 3566

15 ea. UNIT 9.91 8.89 5.00 8.64 10.48 8.02 12.95

SIZE 10", BASTARD FLAT (11885) PRICE 148.65 133.35 75.00 129.60 157.20 120.30 194.25
3. NICHOLSON 3665 OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL Exact Match Nicholson/03665N Nicholson/08642N Nicholson/03665N Nicholson/03665N ATG 3665 Apex 3665

15 ea. UNIT 13.56 12.17 9.00 11.84 14.36 10.98 18.95

SIZE 12", BASTARD FLAT (11886) PRICE 203.40 182.55 135.00 177.60 215.40 164.70 284.25
4. NICHOLSON 3764 OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL Exact Match Nicholson/03764N Nicholson/03764N Nicholson/03764N Nicholson/03764N ATG 3764 Apex 3764

20 ea. UNIT 18.71 16.78 12.00 16.33 20.30 15.20 20.95

SIZE 14", BASTARD FLAT (11889) PRICE 374.20 335.60 240.00 326.60 406.00 304.00 419.00
5. NICHOLSON 3863 OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL Exact Match Nicholson/03863N Nicholson/03863N Nicholson/03863 Nicholson/03863N ATG 3863 Apex 3863

15 ea. UNIT 6.09 5.46 4.00 5.30  4.92 8.95

NICHOLSON 11781 OR APPROVED EQUAL PRICE 91.35 81.90 60.00 79.50  73.80 134.25
6. SIZE 6", BASTARD ROUND, RAT TAIL (11892) TOTAL Exact Match Nicholson/11781 Nicholson/11781 Nicholson/11781N NO BID ATG 11781 Apex 11781

10 ea. UNIT 7.62 6.83 5.00 6.64 8.06 6.16 10.95

SIZE 10", BASTARD ROUND (11890) PRICE 76.20 68.30 50.00 66.40 80.60 61.60 109.50
7. NICHOLSON 12019 OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL Exact Match Nicholson/12019 Nicholson/12019 Nicholson/12019 Nicholson/12019 ATG 12019 Apex 12019

40 ea. UNIT 23.21 22.63 10.00 22.03 26.72 20.42 29.95

SIZE 14", RASP HORSE FILE, (15086) PRICE 928.40 905.20 400.00 881.20 1,068.80 816.80 1,198.00
8. NICHOLSON 18057N OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL Exact Match Nicholson/18057N Nicholson/12248 Nicholson/18057N 809339 ATG 18057 Apex 18057W

 *
        
TOTAL GROUP 7 TOTAL 2,006.90 1,872.45 1,037.25 1,822.10  1,690.65 2,603.00
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GROUP 8 CHISELS:
15 ea. UNIT 8.38 4.73 2.25 3.34  1.57  
SIZE 1/2", COLD (10343) PRICE 125.70 70.95 33.75 50.10  23.55  

1. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Exact Match Gearwrench 82264 Stanley/16-287 Stanley/16-287 NO BID Voughn 14950803 NO BID
25 ea. UNIT 19.89 7.66 3.00 4.15  3.03  
SIZE 3/4", COLD (10344) PRICE 497.25 191.50 75.00 103.75  75.75  

2. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Exact Match Gearwrench 82266 Stanley/16-289 Stanley/16-289 NO BID Voughn 14950802 NO BID
35 ea. UNIT 17.00 10.98 10.00 16.84  6.05  
SIZE 1" X 7 1/2", COLD (10342) PRICE 595.00 384.30 350.00 589.40  211.75  

3. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Exact Match Gearwrench 82268 Proto/J8GA7/8x8 Stanley/16-291 NO BID Dasco 417-0 NO BID
10 ea. UNIT 12.85 13.15  11.30  9.83  
SIZE 1-1/2", WOOD (10346) PRICE 128.50 131.50  113.00  98.30  

4. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Exact Match Stanley/16-980 NO BID Stanley/16-324 NO BID Stanley 16-324 NO BID
 *
 
TOTAL GROUP 8 TOTAL 1,346.45 778.25  856.25  409.35  

GROUP 9 SAW:
50 ea. UNIT 21.65 18.10 12.00 17.03  15.65  
SAW PVC W/BLADE 18IN HSF180, LENOX 20980 (15586) PRICE 1,082.50 905.00 600.00 851.50  782.50  

1. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Exact Match Lenox/20980 Lenox/2098GHSF18 Lenox/2098GHSF18 NO BID Lenox/2098GHSF8 NO BID
20 ea. UNIT 23.96 6.77 12.00 19.92  10.57  
SAW HAND 8 POINT 26 IN, STANLEY 15-526 (15587) PRICE 479.20 135.40 240.00 398.40  211.40  

2. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Exact Match Stanley/15-726 Stanley/15-526 Stanley/20-065 NO BID 20-526 NO BID
 *
 
TOTAL GROUP 9 TOTAL 1,561.70 1,040.40 840.00 1,249.90  993.90  

GROUP 10 MISCELLANEOUS TOOLS:
15 ea. PRICE 45.99 37.34 35.00 117.64  40.97  
SIZE 20" X 8-1/2" X 9-1/2", TOOL BOX (16850) TOTAL 689.85 560.10 525.00 1,764.60  614.55  

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto/JJ9975R Gearwrench/83130 Proto/J9975-NA Kennedy K20B NO BID Proto J9975NA NO BID
5 sets PRICE 60.10 118.46      
HOLESAW, 1/4" ARBOR ADPT METAL (15890) JOURNEYMANS SET TOTAL 300.50 592.30      

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Stanley/B&D/3073002 Bosch/HB17PL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 sets PRICE 22.89 15.90 15.00 15.66 18.99 14.52  
RULE FOLDING 6FT (15502) TOTAL 114.45 79.50 75.00 78.30 94.95 72.60  

3. LUFKIN 1066D OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL Lufkin 1066D Lufkin 1066D Lufkin 1066D Lufkin 1066D 0957198 Lufkin 1066DN NO BID
5 sets PRICE 17.42 15.44 14.00 15.20 15.20 14.09  
TAPE STEEL CIRCULAR 1/4 X6FT (16525) TOTAL 87.10 77.20 70.00 76.00 76.00 70.45  

4. LUFKIN W606PD OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL Lufkin W606PD Lufkin W606PD Lufkin/W606PD Lufkin/W606PD 11280-01518 Lufkin/W666PD NO BID
5 sets PRICE 122.79 93.85  90.05 90.05 85.66  
TAPE MEASURE NON-METAL 100 FT (16515) TOTAL 613.95 469.25  450.25 450.25 428.30  

5. LUFKIN HD406 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL Lufkin HD406N Lufkin HD406 NO BID Lufkin HD406 0210075 HD406N NO BID
20 ea. PRICE 10.11 7.86 3.25 5.19  8.33  
SIZE 26", SAW, STANDARD CABLE (15602) TOTAL 202.20 157.20 65.00 103.80  166.60  

6. MCMASTER CARR 39705A31 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL McMaster Car/39705A31 McMaster Car/39705A31 General/858 General/858 NO BID  NO BID

6
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30 ea. PRICE 10.11 9.72  14.00    
SIZE 46", SAW, STANDARD CABLE (15603) TOTAL 303.30 291.60  420.00    

7. MCMASTER CARR 39705A32 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL McMaster Car/39705A31 Plumb Pro/T-Handle Saw NO BID McMaster Carr 39705A32 NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 ea. PRICE 71.38 54.57  52.36  49.81  
MEASURING WHEEL, TAPE, (16512) TOTAL 1,427.60 1,091.40  1,047.20  996.20  

8. SIZE 0 – 9999 FEET LUFKIN MW38 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL Lufkin PSMW48N Lufkin PSMW48N NO BID Lufkin PSMW48N NO BID PSMW48N NO BID
70 sets PRICE 88.57 25.98 25.00   47.92  
PUMP UTILITY 1 1/2 DIS 13 GPM, (15067) TOTAL 6,199.90 1,818.60 1,750.00   3,354.40  

9. BECKSON 136PF6 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL Beckon/B136PF36 Beckson/136PF6 Beckson/13GPF NO BID NO BID Beckson/136PF6 NO BID
75 ea. PRICE 82.86 67.00      
SETTER VALVE 4-12IN, (33730) TOTAL 6,214.50 5,025.00      

10. RAPTOR 41038 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL Pollard Ward PP572 USA Blue Book/75190 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15 ea. PRICE 34.02 26.99 25.00 24.05 28.46 24.07  
GUN GREASE LEVERTYPE, (13021) TOTAL 510.30 404.85 375.00 360.75 426.90 361.05  

11. LINCOLN 1142 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL Lincoln 33402 Lincoln/1142 Lincoln/1142 Lincoln/1142 Lincoln/1142 GRC 104SL37019 NO BID
 *
 
TOTAL GROUP 10 TOTAL 16,663.65 10,567.00      

GROUP 11 PROTO PRICE LIST (ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE $45,000)

 

 

  It's no longer *
 available

Price List Catalog Number ISSIAS400 electronically only PRCAT108 www.aiwdirect.com  

Discount Off Price List (%) 0.25 38% 55.5% -10%  
 

Multiplier for Discount 0.75 0.62 .445 .90  

Effective Date of Price List 01/01/19 12/01/18 2016 At time of inquiry    

GROUP 12 GOLDBLATT (STANLEY) PRICE LIST (ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE $20,000)

 

1.  

  It's no longer *
 available

Price List Catalog Number ISSIAS400 electronically only PRCAT108 www.aiwdirect.com    

Discount Off Price List (%) 0.25 38% 45% -10%    

Multiplier for Discount 0.75 0.62 .55 .90    
   

Effective Date of Price List 01/01/19 12/01/18 2016 At time of inquiry    

GROUP 13 RIDGID PRICE LIST (ESTIMATED USAGE $12,000)

 

1.

 *

 Available electronically

Price List Catalog Number AS400 only PL1218 www.aiwdirect.com    

Discount Off Price List (%) 5 10% 12% -10%    
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 19-0401

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Non-Electrical Hand Tools

TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2019)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 28, 2019
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Multiplier for Discount 0.95 0.90 .88 .90    

Effective Date of Price List 01/01/19 12/01/18 12/01/18 At time of inquiry    

GROUP 14 KLEIN PRICE LIST (ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE $10,000)

   

  

*
 

Price List Catalog Number ISSIAS400 N/A Use Price List 2019 www.aiwdirect.com

Discount Off Price List (%) 25% N/A 25% -10%

Multiplier for Discount .75 N/A .75 .90

Effective Date of Price List 01/01/19 N/A 01/01/19 At time of inquiry

GROUP 15 COOPER PRICE LIST (ESTIMATED USAGE $10,000)

 

  

*
 

Price List Catalog Number ISSIAS400 T550859 2019 www.aiwdirect.com    

Discount Off Price List (%) 25% 48% 40% -10%    

Multiplier for Discount .75 0.52 .60 .90    

Effective Date of Price List 01/01/19 01/01/19 Jan. 2019 At time of inquiry    

GROUP 16 REED PRICE LIST (Estimated Usage $12,000)

 

*
 

Price List Catalog Number ISSIAS400 N/A N/A www.aiwdirect.com

Discount Off Price List (%) 5% N/A N/A -10%

Multiplier for Discount 0.95 N/A N/A .90

Effective Date of Price List 01/01/19 N/A N/A At time of inquiry

GROUP 17 ARMSTRONG PRICE LIST (ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE $20,000)
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 19-0401

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Non-Electrical Hand Tools

TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2019)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 28, 2019
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*
 Available

Price List Catalog Number ISSIAS400 electronically only www.aiwdirect.com   

Discount Off Price List (%) 25% 48% -10%   

Multiplier for Discount 0.75 0.52 .90   

Effective Date of Price List 01/01/19 12/01/18 At time of inquiry    

GROUP 18 GEARWRENCH PRICE LIST (ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE $45,000)

 

*
 Available

Price List Catalog Number ISSIAS400 electronically only www.aiwdirect.com

Discount Off Price List (%) 25% 49% -10%

Multiplier for Discount .75 0.51 .90

Effective Date of Price List 01/01/19 12/01/18 At time of inquiry

EXTENSION 1 25,816.45 85,567.00 80,807.65 560.35 1,210.05

EXTESNION 2 25,816.45 85,567.00 80,807.65 560.35 1,210.05

EXTESNION 3 25,816.45 85,567.00 80,807.65 560.35 1,210.05

EXTESNION 4 25,816.45 85,567.00 80,807.65 560.35 1,210.05

Net 2% Net Net Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 10 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days 7 days 7-10 days 1-3 days 2-28 days 2 weeks  30 days

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
 
AIW MSC Direct Demandstar
Baytech Supply PD Morrison Enterprises SAWS Website

 Fastenal Royall Matthiesen
Grainger Safety Supply
HD Supply Sunbelt
Industrial Supply Solutions Tool Mart
Klingspor Corp. White Cap

Mapa Distribution
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